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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 SMALL MOTOR REPAIR 10 TO 250 HP and includes rewinding,

 reconditioning, machine-work, and tear-down, inspect and

ITEM 1: repair

  UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 130.00 500.00 287.00 450.00 NO BID

1. Single-Phase, up to 10 HP Recondition TOTAL 1,040.00 4,000.00 2,296.00 3,600.00

UNIT

8 ea, PRICE 500.00 1,000.00 398.00 1,300.00 NO BID

2. Single-Phase, up to 10 HP Rewind TOTAL 4,000.00 8,000.00 3,184.00 10,400.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 255.00 500.00 323.00 450.00 NO BID

3. Three-Phase, up to 10 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,040.00 4,000.00 2,584.00 3,600.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 515.00 1,000.00 490.00 1,200.00 NO BID

4. Three-Phase, up to 10 HP Rewind TOTAL 4,120.00 8,000.00 3,920.00 9,600.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 360.00 500.00 391.00 695.00 NO BID

5. Three-Phase, 15 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,880.00 4,000.00 3,128.00 5,560.00

UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 695.00 1,000.00 571.00 1,600.00 NO BID

6. Three-Phase, 15 HP Rewind TOTAL 5,560.00 8,000.00 4,568.00 12,800.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 360.00 500.00 391.00 695.00 NO BID

7. Three-Phase, 20 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,880.00 4,000.00 3,128.00 5,560.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 764.00 1,000.00 660.00 1,700.00 NO BID

8. Three-Phase, 20 HP Rewind TOTAL 6,112.00 8,000.00 5,280.00 13,600.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 420.00 500.00 476.00 1,015.00 NO BID

9. three-Phase, 25 HP Recondition TOTAL 3,360.00 4,000.00 3,808.00 8,120.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 850.00 1,000.00 850.00 1,890.00 NO BID

10. Three-Phase, 25 HP Rewind TOTAL 6,800.00 8,000.00 6,800.00 15,120.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 420.00 519.00 476.00 1,015.00 NO BID

11. Three-Phase, 30 HP Recondition TOTAL 3,360.00 4,152.00 3,808.00 8,120.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 900.00 1,069.00 950.00 1,975.00 NO BID

12. Three-Phase, 30 HP rewind TOTAL 7,200.00 8,552.00 7,600.00 15,800.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 519.00 639.00 624.00 1,300.00 NO BID

13. Three-Phase, 40 HP Recondition TOTAL 4,152.00 5,112.00 4,992.00 10,400.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,200.00 1,274.00 1,270.00 2,500.00 NO BID

14. Three-Phase, 40 HP Rewind TOTAL 9,600.00 10,192.00 10,160.00 20,000.00

 UNIT

 8 ea. PRICE 519.00 639.00 624.00 1,300.00 NO BID

15. Three-Phase, 50 HP Recondition TOTAL 4,152.00 5,112.00 4,992.00 10,400.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,400.00 1,538.00 1,521.00 2,800.00 NO BID

16. Three-Phase, 50 HP Rewind TOTAL 11,200.00 12,304.00 12,168.00 22,400.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 639.00 790.00 772.00 1,530.00 NO BID

17. Three-Phase, 60 HP Recondition TOTAL 5,112.00 6,320.00 6,176.00 12,240.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,500.00 1,760.00 1,986.00 3,375.00 NO BID

18 Three-Phase, 60 HP Rewind TOTAL 12,000.00 14,080.00 15,888.00 27,000.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 921.00 790.00 772.00 1,530.00 NO BID

19. Three-Phase, 75 HP Recondition TOTAL 7,368.00 6,320.00 6,176.00 12,240.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,700.00 2,063.00 2,262.00 3,475.00 NO BID

20. Three-Phase, 75 HP Rewind TOTAL 13,600.00 16,504.00 18,096.00 27,800.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,000.00 965.00 997.00 1,875.00 NO BID

21. Three-Phase, 100 HP Recondition TOTAL 8,000.00 7,720.00 7,976.00 15,000.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,800.00 2,574.00 2,807.00 4,475.00 NO BID

22. Three-Phase, 100 HP Rewind TOTAL 14,400.00 20,592.00 22,456.00 35,800.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,200.00 965.00 1,193.00 1,875.00 NO BID

23. Three-Phase, 125 HP Recondition TOTAL 9,600.00 7,720.00 9,544.00 15,000.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 2,500.00 2,980.00 3,369.00 4,575.00 NO BID

24. Three-Phase, 125 HP Rewind TOTAL 20,000.00 23,840.00 26,952.00 36,600.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,302.00 965.00 1,193.00 1,875.00 NO BID

25. Three-Phase, 150 HP Recondition TOTAL 10,416.00 7,720.00 9,544.00 15,000.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 2,500.00 3,451.00 3,812.00 5,675.00 NO BID

26. Three-Phase, 150 HP Rewind TOTAL 20,000.00 27,608.00 30,496.00 45,400.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 1,482.00 1,151.00 1,406.00 2,200.00 NO BID

27. Three-Phase, 200 HP Recondition TOTAL 11,856.00 9,208.00 11,248.00 17,600.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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 UNIT

8 Units PRICE 3,000.00 4,225.00 4,761.00 7,400.00 NO BID

28. Three-Phase, 200 HP Rewind TOTAL 24,000.00 33,800.00 38,088.00 59,200.00

 UNIT

8 Units PRICE 1,600.00 1,151.00 1,406.00 2,200.00 NO BID

29. Three-Phase, 250 HP Recondition TOTAL 12,800.00 9,208.00 11,248.00 17,600.00

 UNIT

8 Units PRICE 3,500.00 4,949.00 5,707.00 8,400.00 NO BID

30. Three-Phase, 250 HP Rewind TOTAL 28,000.00 39,592.00 45,656.00 67,200.00

  

      NO BID

 Sub Total for Item 1 TOTAL 275,608.00 335,656.00 341,960.00 578,760.00

Item 2 Purchase or Manufactured Parts      

      NO BID

a. Estimated Annual Purchase $20,000.00  20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00

  

  4,000.00 3,800.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 NO BID

b. Add Cost Plus Mark Up % % 20% 19% 15% 20%

  

      NO BID

c. Total (a+b) TOTAL 24,000.00 23,800.00 23,000.00 24,000.00

Item 3 Service UNIT

800 PRICE 30.00 58.00 65.00 65.00 NO BID

1. In Shop Repair Labor TOTAL 24,000.00 46,400.00 52,000.00 52,000.00

 UNIT

200 PRICE 30.00 70.00 95.00 75.00 NO BID

2. Field Service Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 14,000.00 19,000.00 15,000.00

 UNIT

200 PRICE 30.00 50.00 70.00 65.00 NO BID

3. Machine Shop Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 10,000.00 14,000.00 13,000.00

UNIT

 PRICE     NO BID

 Sub Total for Item 3 TOTAL 36,000.00 70,400.00 85,000.00 80,000.00

Item 4 Emergency Service UNIT

50 hours PRICE 40.00 60.00 75.00 97.50 NO BID

1. Emergency Service (5 day or less) TOTAL 2,000.00 3,000.00 3,750.00 4,875.00

  UNIT     

   PRICE     NO BID

 Sub Total for Item 4 TOTAL 2,000.00 3,000.00 3,750.00 4,875.00

  UNIT *    

  PRICE     NO BID

 Grand Total for Group 1, Items 1-4 TOTAL 337,608.00 432,856.00 453,710.00 687,635.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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GROUP 2 Large Motors (greater than 250 HP) and includes rewinding, UNIT

reconditioning, machine-work, and tear-down, inspect and repair

 4 ea. PRICE 2,500.00 2,749.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. Three-Phase, 300 HP Recondition TOTAL 10,000.00 10,996.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 3,500.00 10,370.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Three-Phase, 300 HP Rewind TOTAL 14,000.00 41,480.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 2,713.00 2,929.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Three-Phase, 350 HP Recondition TOTAL 10,852.00 11,716.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 3,700.00 11,012.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Three-Phase, 350 HP Rewind TOTAL 14,800.00 44,048.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 2,743.00 3,274.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

5. Three-Phase, 400 HP Recondition TOTAL 10,972.00 13,096.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 4,500.00 11,599.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

6. Three-Phase, 400 HP Rewind TOTAL 18,000.00 46,396.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 2,921.00 3,274.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

7. Three-Phase, 450 HP Recondition TOTAL 11,684.00 13,096.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 5,100.00 12,322.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

8. Three-Phase, 450 HP Rewind TOTAL 20,400.00 49,288.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 3,200.00 3,614.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

9. Three-Phase, 500 HP Recondition TOTAL 12,800.00 14,456.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 5,700.00 12,991.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10. Three-Phase, 500 HP Rewind TOTAL 22,800.00 51,964.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 4,500.00 3,898.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

11. Three-Phase, 600 HP Recondition TOTAL 18,000.00 15,592.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 6,700.00 14,148.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

12. Three-Phase, 600 HP Rewind TOTAL 26,800.00 56,592.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 4,000.00 4,362.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

13. Three-Phase, 700 HP Recondition TOTAL 16,000.00 17,448.00    
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 7,100.00 15,395.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

14. Three-Phase, 700 HP Rewind TOTAL 28,400.00 61,580.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 5,100.00 4,649.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

15. Three-Phase, 800 HP Recondition TOTAL 20,400.00 18,596.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 7,600.00 17,135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

16. Three-Phase, 800 HP Rewind TOTAL 30,400.00 68,540.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 4,000.00 4,809.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

17. Three-Phase, 900 HP Recondition TOTAL 16,000.00 19,236.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 8,700.00 18,808.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

18. Three-Phase, 900 HP Rewind TOTAL 34,800.00 75,232.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 5,000.00 5,988.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

19. Three-Phase, 1000 HP Recondition TOTAL 20,000.00 23,952.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 10,000.00 20,123.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

20. Three-Phase, 1000 HP Rewind TOTAL 40,000.00 80,492.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 8,000.00 6,786.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

21. Three-Phase, 1750 HP Recondition TOTAL 32,000.00 27,144.00    

 UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 14,760.00 30,887.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

22. Three-Phase, 1750 HP Rewind TOTAL 59,040.00 123,548.00    

  

    NO BID NO BID NO BID

 Sub Total for Item 1 TOTAL 488,148.00 884,488.00    

Item 2 Purchase or Manufactured Parts  

    NO BID NO BID NO BID

a. Estimated Annual Purchase $20,000.00  20,000.00 20,000.00    

  

  4,000.00 3,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

b. Add Cost Plus Mark Up % % 20% 19%    

  

    NO BID NO BID NO BID

c. Total (a+b)  24,000.00 23,800.00    
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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Item 3  UNIT

800 PRICE 30.00 58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. In Shop Repair Labor TOTAL 24,000.00 46,400.00    

 UNIT

200 PRICE 30.00 70.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Field Service Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 14,000.00    

 UNIT

200 PRICE 30.00 50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Machine Shop Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 10,000.00    

 

  NO BID NO BID NO BID

 Sub Total for Item 3 TOTAL 36,000.00 70,400.00    

Item 4 Emergency Service  

50 hours  40.00 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. Emergency Service (5 days turnaround) TOTAL 2,000.00 3,000.00    

     

      NO BID NO BID NO BID

 Sub Total for Item 4 TOTAL 2,000.00 3,000.00    

  *  

   NO BID NO BID NO BID

 Grand Total for Group 2 Items 1-4 TOTAL 550,148.00 981,688.00    

Grand Total for Groups 1 & 2 TOTAL 887,756.00 1,414,544.00 453,710.00 687,635.00 NO BID

EXTENSION 1 887,756.00

EXTENSION 2 887,756.00

EXTENSION 3 887,756.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (April 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 18, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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Net Net 2%

Terms  30 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days

*LOW BIDDER  

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Austin Armature Works Demandstar

Clifford Power SAWS Website

Evans Enterprises, Inc.

Lonestar Armature

Massengale Armature Works
Mikes Electric Motors

Paramount Electric Motors

San Antonio Armature Works

Smith Pump 
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